
TABULATION

TRAFFIC SIGNALS AND EQUIPMENT

ITB 41-23

CHARLES LINDSEY

LINDSEYC@JCCAL.ORG 1 2

Temple, Inc

 CDK ENTERPRISES DBA 

SOUTHERN LIGHTING & 

TRAFFIC SYSTEMS

Item Description as specified or approved equal Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

1 LOAD SWITCH for TS1 and TS2 cabinet 1 EA $33.00 NO BID

2
NEMA 16 phase Base mount Cabinet TS2 

Type 1 meets ALDOT specifications 1 EA $15,878.00 NO BID

3
NEMA 16 phase Pole mount Cabinet TS2 

Type 1 meets ALDOT specifications 1 EA $12,825.00 $13,950.00

4
NEMA 16 phase Base mount Cabinet Type 1 1 EA $15,110.00 $13,950.00

5
NEMA 16 phase Pole mount Cabinet Type 1 1 EA $10,706.00 NO BID

6 NEMA FLASHER 1 EA $32.00 NO BID

7 SSM-12LEC MONITOR WITH CABLE 1 EA $960.00 NO BID

8 MMU16-LE Monitor with cable 1 EA $1,085.00 NO BID

9 4 Channel Loop Detector, Nema 1 EA $371.00 NO BID

10 EDI LMD301T DETECTORS 1 EA $207.00 NO BID

11 FLASH RELAYS 1 EA $34.00 NO BID

12
4 Channel Loop Card Rack Assembly, Nema 

shelf mount 1 EA $280.00 NO BID

$57,521.00 $27,900.00
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YES YES

YES YES

YES YES

Affidavit of Contractor
YES YES

YES YES

Debarment Statement YES YES

Signature Page YES YES

Contact Information:

1 TEMPLE, INC

2

 CDK ENTERPRISES DBA SOUTHERN 

LIGHTING & TRAFFIC SYSTEMS
11 INDUSTRIAL PARK DRIVE; CUMMINS, GA, 30040; JAMIE JONES; 

205-999-1950; JJONES@SOUTHRTNENLTG.COM

305 BANK ST, DECATUR, AL,35601 TIM OLINGER; 256-353-4578; 

Notification of Intent to Respond

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form

Bid Form

REQUIRED FORMS

mailto:LINDSEYC@JCCAL.ORG

